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ACTION & ADVENTURE

MONDO BIZARRO

In 1966, the notorious producer, director and distributor team of Lee
Frost and Bob Cresse combined the extremes of the Mondo genre with
their own depraved aesthetic to create several shockumentaries that
changed the face of exploitation forever.

Read More
SKU: c9e50bc0eb36

https://screenboundfilms.com/title/mondo-bizarro/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=Mondo+Bizarro
https://screenboundfilms.com/title/mondo-bizarro/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=Mondo+Bizarro
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DOCUMENTARY

MONDO BIZARRO

In 1966, the notorious producer, director and distributor team of Lee
Frost and Bob Cresse combined the extremes of the Mondo genre with
their own depraved aesthetic to create several shockumentaries that
changed the face of exploitation forever.

Read More
SKU: c9e50bc0eb36

MONDO FREUDO

A "hidden camera" takes the viewer on a worldwide tour of sexual
practices and rituals, including Tijuana strippers, Asian sex shows,
British prostitutes, New York devil worshipers and a Mexican slave
market.

Read More
SKU: 0a94cdb33df7

https://screenboundfilms.com/title/mondo-bizarro/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=Mondo+Bizarro
https://screenboundfilms.com/title/mondo-bizarro/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=Mondo+Bizarro
https://screenboundfilms.com/title/mondo-freudo/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=Mondo+Freudo
https://screenboundfilms.com/title/mondo-freudo/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=Mondo+Freudo
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DRAMA

THE SCAVENGERS

Renegade Confederate soldiers take over a frontier town, but after they
molest a young black woman, a group of ex-slaves arm themselves and
counter-attack.

Read More
SKU: 7de76e6c9eb7

https://screenboundfilms.com/title/scavengers-the/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=The+Scavengers
https://screenboundfilms.com/title/scavengers-the/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=The+Scavengers
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DRAMA, CRIME

THE PICK UP

Two mob money couriers, Frankie and Tony, have their latest package
of $1 million stolen by two con women, Dana and Marcia, in which the
men must find the women to recover the money before they become
marked men.

Read More
SKU: N/A

https://screenboundfilms.com/title/the-pick-up/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=The+Pick+Up
https://screenboundfilms.com/title/the-pick-up/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=The+Pick+Up
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EROTICA

MONDO FREUDO

A "hidden camera" takes the viewer on a worldwide tour of sexual
practices and rituals, including Tijuana strippers, Asian sex shows,
British prostitutes, New York devil worshipers and a Mexican slave
market.

Read More
SKU: 0a94cdb33df7

https://screenboundfilms.com/title/mondo-freudo/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=Mondo+Freudo
https://screenboundfilms.com/title/mondo-freudo/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=Mondo+Freudo
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WESTERN

HOT SPUR

A deranged stablehand kidnaps the wife of a ranch owner to avenge the
rape of his sister

Read More
SKU: N/A

THE SCAVENGERS

Renegade Confederate soldiers take over a frontier town, but after they
molest a young black woman, a group of ex-slaves arm themselves and
counter-attack.

Read More
SKU: 7de76e6c9eb7

https://screenboundfilms.com/title/hot-spur/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=Hot+Spur
https://screenboundfilms.com/title/hot-spur/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=Hot+Spur
https://screenboundfilms.com/title/scavengers-the/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=The+Scavengers
https://screenboundfilms.com/title/scavengers-the/?utm_source=file&utm_medium=PDF&utm_campaign=Screenbound-Films&utm_term=The+Scavengers
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